AGENDA PLACEMENT FORM
(Submission Deadline — Monday, 5:00 PM before Regular Court Meetings)

Court Decision:
Date: 3 . l 7 . 25 This section to be completed by County Judge's Office

Meeting Date: 3.24.25

Submitted By: [ ance Anderson

(May attach additional sheets if necessary)

Person to Present: [ance Anderson

(Presenter must be present for the item unless the item is on the Consent Agenda)

Supporting Documentation: (check one) PUBLIC (1 CONFIDENTIAL

(PUBLIC documentation may be made available to the public prior to the Meeting)

Estimated Length of Presentation: 5 minutes

Session Requested: (check one)

Action Item [] Consent [] Workshop [] Executive [] Other

Check All Departments That Have Been Notified:
[] County Attorney ) [J Purchasing [] Auditor

[J Personnel [J Public Works [J Facilities Management
Other Department/Official (list) PCT 1,2.3 & 4

Please List All External Persons Who Need a Copy of Signed Documents
In Your Submission Email
Approved in CC on 9/11/2023
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RFB 2025-400
ROAD MATERIALS (ADDITIONAL ITEMS)

ATLAS ASPHALT, INC

REYNOLDS ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION

MATERIAL MATERIAL
Pick Up | Delivered | Unit of Measure Min. Order Required Pick Up | Delivered Unit of Measure Min. Order Required
(If applicable) (If applicable)
Washed Pea Gravel Washed Pea Gravel NB NB
HMA TYPE D (DOG ROCK/D-ROCK) HMA TYPE D (DOG ROCK/D-ROCK)
$ 7700) % 91.00 TON
PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il
WISPREAD FEE W/SPREAD FEE NB NB
PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE I PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il
3000 LBS SUPER STACKS 3000 LBS SUPER STACKS NB NB
EZ STREET ASPHALT EZ STREET ASPHALT
50 LBS BAGS $ 13.50 Bag 56 Bags 50 LBS BAGS NB NB
Notes: Notes: .
THE EZ STREET COMPANY VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LLC
MATERIAL MATERIAL
| Min. Order Required Min. Order Required
Pick Up | Delivered |Unitof Measure ,: (If applicable) Pick Up | Delivered Unit of Measure (If applicable)
Washed Pea Gravel NA NA NA E NA Washed Pea Gravel NB NB
HMA TYPE D (DOG ROCK/D-ROCK) i HMA TYPE D (DOG ROCK/D-ROCK)
NIA N/A N/A | NIA $1200 $26 62 TON 24 Tons if Delivered
PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE I i PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE 1N
WISPREAD FEE NIA NIA N/A | NIA W/SPREAD FEE NB NB
PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE I i PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE INI
3000 LBS SUPER STACKS N/A N/A N/A | NIA 3000 LBS SUPER STACKS NB NB
EZ STREET ASPHALT { EZ STREET ASPHALT
$16.50/ba |
S0LBS BAGS g $16.50bag| 50LBSBAG | 1Pallet (56bags) |°0LBSBAGS NB NB
Notes: Price per bag includes delivery to all precincts. Possible per bag discount for larger orders. Notes:




RFB 2025-400
ROAD MATERIALS (ADDITIONAL ITEMS)

ARCOSA AGGREGATES, INC MATERIAL AUSTIN ASPHALT, INC
MATERIAL
; Min. Order Required Min. Order Required
i Pick Up | Delivered Unit of Measure nm ap::ic:l:::]re PickUp | Delivered Unit of Measure n[" ap;:ic:;:}re
1
| Washed Pea Gravel $ 2300 38 Washed Pea Cravel NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
‘: HMA TYPE D (DOG ROCK/D-
|HMA TYPE D (DOG ROCK/D-RQCK) ROCK)
b Precinct 1- 46 Miles $82.50 $103.83 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
| PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il Precinct 2- 26 Miles $82.50 $97 .17 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
iWISPREAD FEE Precinct 3- 34 Miles $82.50 $99.83 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
EPORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il Precinct 4- 43 Miles $82.50 $102.83 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
13000 LBS SUPER STACKS PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il
EEZ STREET ASPHALT W/SPREAD FEE NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
]
i50 LBS BAGS PORTLAND CEMENT TYPE Il NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3000 LBS SUPER STACKS
Notes:Location Kimball Bend EZ STREET ASPHALT (50 Pound
Bags) NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
High Perfmance Patching Material
$153.00
Precinct 1- 46 Miles $15300) $17433 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
Precinct 2- 26 Miles $153.00, $16767 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
Precinct 3- 34 Miles $153.00, $170.33 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered
Precinct 4- 43 Miles $153.000 $17333 Ton 25 Tons-Delivered

Notes- Austin Asphalt does not offer 50 pour:id bags in the Ez Street Asphalit.
We do offera ngh Performance Patchlng Material by the ton- Prices are above.




